
Wrath nf
A Nocturnal Edition-Issue 2

Saturday 6 April—Not as late as yesterday (we hope!)

Repent Sinners!
We have noticed what can 
only be described as rampant 
Ghodlessness raging through 
the convention. This is your 
final warning. Unless you 
develop a sense of religious 
fervour by midnight tomorrow, 
you're all going to perish in 
fire and brimstone.
means yon! And not just any 
Ghod either, by the way; it 
had better be the one true 
church. If only we could 
remember which one that is.

Monstrous 
Regiment of Women 
[and one man]
A sweepstakes has been 
started. For your chance to 
win vast prizes, all you have to 
do is guess which members of 
the Intuition committee will 
resign before Easter Monday 
1996. Entries on the back of a 
Wonderbra.

Paw Show
The hotel has announced that 
bear feet cannot be tolerated 
in public areas of the hotel. All 
bears present should report to 
security for amputation. 
Crutches will be provided by 
the hotel. This means you, 
Square.

Floozy in the
Jacuzzi #2

Our intrepid editor relaxing in 
the pool following several 
hours struggling with the 
printer trying to finish issue 
#1. Instead of "six pages per 
minute" we were getting six 
minutes per page. This means 
that issue #1 is a rare 
collectors edition.
What you can't tell from the 
picture is that following an 
edict from the hotel, bare feet 
have been outlawed in the 
Jacuzzi and Steve is actually 
wearing socks (supplied by the 
hotel. If only they'd had some 
trunks).

Intermediate 
Schmintermediate
We'd like to announce that 
the convention charity has 
been changed by unanimous 
acclaim (yay!) to Superfluous 
Technology, the organisation 
that raises money for rich 
newsletter producers with 
more computers than sense. If 
you'd like to help defray the 

cost of our laser printers, small 
notes are welcome. Beer also.

Editorial Team
Finds Art Show 
Shock!
After several days of searching, 
we can finally explain the 
secret of finding the art show. 
You will need the iron key, 
and the magic word is 
rLuqb.

Costuming coquette Miki (19) 
likes nothing better than to 
show off her lovely 
foundations. A tasty choice for 
our page 3 pinup? Corset is!

Tudor for TAFF or 
We Curry the Kitten
For those of you following the 

TAFF race; sorry, but the kitten 
has already been curried. 
£3.50 a plate from the 
Connaught and Belvedere.
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A Hotel Named
Mobius
Representatives of Zagreb in 
99 are giving out Mobius strips 
in an effort to help people find 
their way around the Radisson 
Heinleinian. Meanwhile, Mr 
Mobius himself will be 
explaining later how he's 
designing the proposed new 
escalators for the hotel.

Ex-ter-min-8
Our intrepid reporter Chris 
Cooper found himself turned 
away from the Tall Technical 
Tales panel. Rumours that he 
was considered insufficiently 
tall are false. Actually, he's 
insufficiently technical. Con 
chair Bridget "Davros" 
Hardcastle explained: "He's 
got the wheelchair, but he still 
needs the egg whisk and sink 
plunger."

Mythology For 
Beginners (2)
Leda, the Swan, the Shower 
Of Gold and its Lover
Zeus, and indeed many of the 
gods of ancient times were 
wont to visit their human 
lovers in the form of a bull, 
shower of gold, swan or other 
suitably stimulating shape. This 
was a little hard on those 
unlucky lovers who ended up 
groaning under several 
hundredweight of gold bullion, 
and so almighty Ghu has 
agreed to move with the times. 
Any reader of this newsletter 
contacting their favourite deity 
(by means of the voodoo 
board, naturally), may expect 
a visitation from Ghu in the 
form of a shower of cheques, 
credit cards and BACS 
transfers. What's more, we are 
assured that the chances you 
will become pregnant from an 
electronic transfer of funds are 
considered by many 
gynaecologists to be extremely 
low. If on the other hand you 
are visited by Ghu in the form 
of a moose, you're in deep 
shit, girl.

Wiped
We have a slight correction to 
the article in Primordial Slime 
entitled 'Audio Wiped'. In 
fact, due to a complete 
understanding among the tech 
crew, Dave Lally has been 
wiped. From now on all 
programme items will be 
conducted in semaphore.

Spot The Moose
Somewhere, in the following 
picture, a moose is carefully 
concealed. Spot the moose 
and win a mystery prize! All

you have to do is put an X on 
the photo where you think the 
moose is hiding.

Moosetake
We must apologise for the 
previous article in which we 
incorrectly identified a moose 
as Spot. It was in fact Shag the 
Moose.

Feedback on #1
"I'm impressed... Haven't you 
had enough you stupid 
bastards?"

PM

From The Hotel
You may not take bare feet 
into the pool area (and all 
glasses must be covered by 
flip-flops while crossing the 
lobby).

Wrath of Ghu 2 is not, repeat 
not a hoax! It is an alternate 
newsletter. It did not evolve 
but sprang fully formed from 
the loins, ribs and other choice 
cuts of:
Alison Scott (T-bone), Steve 
Davies (Prime Rib), Chris 
Cooper (Fillet of Left Leg), Tim 
(Broad Rib), Steven Cain 
(Streaky Rasher), Pat 
McMurray (Hamburger), Mike 
Scott (Ox tail) and assorted 
tripe.
Two issues and still no 
footnotes!2
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